

Surface Pro Bid Tabulation

<u>Device</u>	<u>Specs</u>	<u>Microsoft</u>	<u>CDW-G</u>	<u>Staples</u>	<u>Best Buy</u>
Surface Pro 3	i3 64 GB	\$719.10	\$736.00	\$766.11	no bid
Surface Pro 3	i5 128 GB	\$899.10	\$919.00	\$957.76	no bid
Surface Pro 3	i5 256 GB	\$1,169.10	\$1,170.54	\$1,245.23	no bid
Surface Pro 4	i7 256 GB	\$1,394.10	\$1,396.00	\$1,484.78	no bid
Surface Pro 4	i7 512 GB	\$1,754.10	\$1,756.00	\$1,868.08	no bid

Initial order will include 630 devices for elementary schools.

<u>Device</u>	<u>Specs</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>Lowest bid</u>	<u>Total</u>
Surface Pro 3	i3 64 GB	630	\$719.10	\$453,033.00

Anticipate over 1000 devices will be ordered to fulfill requests from buildings as part of on-going computer replacement cycle.

Sent to 5 vendors, 4 bid responses were received.

Microsoft is located in Dallas, TX